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*Some measurements rounded

LENGTH WIDTH FLAT BOTTOM DEPTH

26’ 6” 10’ 8” 4’ 11”

23’ 4” 10’ 8” 4’ 11”

GENEROUS ENTRY STEPS

FLAT BOTTOM FLOOR

LARGE
SPLASH DECK

DUAL
WEIRS/

HIDDEN
SKMMERS

*PATENT PENDING DESIGN

UNIQUE HIGH WATER LEVEL

SAFETY LEDGE AROUND 
POOL PERIMETER

European style and Australian ingenuity come together 
perfectly to create our newest pool, the Precision™. The 
Precision™ is an incredibly stylish rectangular pool packed with 
our latest design features. With backyards now getting smaller, 
we understand our customers are looking to maximize their 
outdoor space without comprising on quality and features. 
The Precision™ is the perfect pool for you taking contemporary 
design to new levels.

The Precision™ offers our patent pending High Water Line 
design, which includes the incorporation of dual weirs and 
hidden skimmer boxes that allow the Precision™ to be nearly 
filled with water and yet still skim debris off the water surface. 
Once paved, the Precision™, with its innovative dual weirs, 
completely hides your skimmer boxes offering a unique look 
and feel. Any debris on your water surface magically disappears 
into the weirs.

The Precision™ has a beautifully modern rectangular look with 
a large splash deck perfect for your little ones to enjoy the pool 
with you. A single set of stylish stairs flow graciously into your 
large swimming space, with a flat bottom floor which is perfect 
for cooling down on those lazy summer days or playing games 
with family and friends.

For those customers looking to exercise in their pool, The 
Precision™ is the perfect pool with the addition of a swim jet
system allowing you to swim on the spot at your own pace.

Precision™ in Sapphire Blue
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